

SPEC #	BID QTY (CS)	ITEM DESCRIPTION	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
176	250	Sauce, Enchilada: made with rich tomatoes, red chile peppers and select ground spices. 6/#10. Rosarita 52649 or equal.	ROSARITA / 10649	6/ 10	\$30.87	0.247	\$7,717.74	Rosarita 10649	6/106 oz	\$33.98	.0534 oz	\$8,495.00
177	250	Sauce, General Tso: Sauce infused with ginger, molasses and crushed hot peppers. 1.25oz individual serving packs. 1 pouch=1oz EQ Grain. No added MSG. 4/0.5gal/cs. Minors 313105 or equal.	MINOR / 31310	4/.5GL	\$43.27	0.169	\$10,818.42	Minors 313105	4/.5 gal	\$53.22	0.2078	\$13,305.00
178	250	Sauce, Orange Sauce: Sauce infused with ginger, molasses and crushed hot peppers. No added MSG. 4/0.5gal/cs. Minors 313105 or equal.	MINOR / 54742	4/.5 GL	\$34.28	0.1339	\$8,569.15	Minors 54742	4/.5 gal	\$41.95	0.1638	\$10,487.50
179	40	Sauce, Soy, Low Sodium: brewed and aged from wheat, soybeans, water and salt. Contain maximum of 575mg sodium per serving. 4/0.5gal/cs. Kikkoman 00130 or equal.	KIKKOMAN / 00130	6/.5GAL	\$38.09	0.0992	\$1,523.48	Kikkoman 00130	6/.5 gal	\$36.43	.0948 oz	\$1,457.20
180	250	Sauce, Sweet & Sour: Tangy, sweet flavor made up of pineapple chunks, diced tomatoes, green peppers and onion. 4/1gal/cs. LaChoy 4430012691 or equal.	LA CHOY / 12691	4/1 GAL	\$45.01	0.0879	\$11,252.63	La Choy 12691	4/1 gal	\$44.02	.0859 oz	\$11,005.00
SPICES												
181	40	Spice, Cajun Seasoning: No allergens. Dark red with whole seeds visible. Free flowing granular product. 20oz. Sauer 1021 or equal.	C.F.SAUER / 01021	1/20 OZ	\$6.22	0.311	\$248.82	McCormick 974235	18 oz	\$10.66	.592 oz	\$426.40
182	90	Spices, Chili Powder: Light flavor. 1# Plastic jar. Dark red powder. Free flowing powder. Sauer 1066 or equal.	C.F.SAUER / 01066	1/16 OZ	\$4.19	0.2619	\$377.00	Sysco/McCormick 974250	18 oz	\$7.80	.433 oz	\$702.00
183	10	Spice, Cilantro, Dried: Bright green leaves. Pleasant and aromatic. 5% moisture. 6/3 ounces in a clear colorless 32 fluid ounce polyethylene terephthalate container. Bright green leaves. 6-3oz per case. Sauer 01060 or equal.	C.F.SAUER / 01060	1/ 3 OZ	\$4.49	1.49	\$44.93	McCormick 932495	1.25 oz	\$9.11		\$91.10
184	30	Spice, Cinnamon: Pure ground. 1# P.E.T. or vacuum sealed jars. Sauer 2208 or equal. (480oz)	C.F.SAUER / 02208	1/ 5#	\$17.18	0.2148	\$103.10	Sysco/McCormick 974266	14 oz	\$8.78	0.6271	\$301.01
185	60	Spice, Cumin: Ground 16oz bottle. Sauer 1106 or equal.	C.F.SAUER / 01106	1/16 OZ	\$5.65	0.3531	\$339.13	Sysco/McCormick 974065	14 oz	\$5.35	.3343 oz	\$321.00
186	50	Spice, Garden Seasoning, All Natural: 13oz/cs.P.E.T. or vacuum sealed jars. Salt-free blend of onion, spices (including celery see, rosemary and parsley), red & green bell peppers, carrots, tomato, orange peel, garlic and lemon peel. McCormick 935693 or equal. (DURKEE / 2004214	6/19Z	\$77.93	0.5412	\$3,896.50	Mrs. Dash J017	3/21 oz	\$45.99	.73 oz	\$2,299.50
187	50	Spice, Garden Vegetable Seasoning: 6/20oz/cs.P.E.T. or vacuum sealed jars. Salt-free blend onion, spices(including celery seed), garlic, orange peel, red bell peppers, tomato, carrots and parsley. McCormick 937017 or equal. (6000oz)	MCCORMICK / 036607	6/20 Z	\$56.20	0.4683	\$2,809.80	McCormick 937017	20 oz	\$9.40	0.4700	\$2,820.00

SPEC #	BID QTY (CS)	ITEM DESCRIPTION	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
188	150	Spice, Garlic Bread Sprinkle: Combined roasted garlic, romano and parmesan cheeses, and parsley. 20oz/cs. McCormick 932111 or equal. (3000 oz)	MCCORMICK / 932111	6/20 Z	\$92.60	0.7719	\$2,315.70	McCormick 932111	20 oz	\$15.85	0.7925	\$2,377.50
189	150	Spice, Garlic Herb Seasoning, Classic: P.E.T. or vacuum sealed jars. Spice providing herb, onion, garlic flavor. 21oz/cs. Mrs. Dash MD-293 or equal (3150oz)	MRS DASH / MD-293	1/21 OZ	\$15.05	0.7167	\$2,257.61	Mrs. Dash MD-293	3/21 oz	\$45.46	0.7215	\$2,272.73
190	150	Spice, Garlic Powder, Pure: Pure ground garlic with no salt. P.E.T. or vacuum sealed jars. 6/21oz/cs. McCormick 223224 or equal (18,900oz)	MCCORMICK / 223224	6/21 Z	\$54.87	0.4355	\$8,230.95	McCormick 223224	21 oz	\$9.19	0.4376	\$8,270.64
191	50	Spice, Lemon Pepper Seasoning, Classic: P.E.T. or vacuum sealed jars. Lemon flavored enhanced by herbs. 21oz/cs. Mrs. Dash MD-263 or equal	MRS DASH / J060-S6900	3/21 Z	\$44.89	1.469	\$2,244.62	Mrs. Dash MD-263	3/21 oz	\$45.46	.7215 oz	\$2,273.00
192	150	Spice, Onion Powder: Sauer 1820 or equal.	C.F.SAUER / 02223/01820	1/20 OZ	\$5.03	0.2515	\$754.31	Sysco/McCormick 974307	20 oz	\$6.26	.313 oz	\$939.00
193	150	Spice, Onion, Dehydrated: Chopped. Rehydration yield is 1:8 or better. 3#/cs. McCormick 979614 or equal	BASIC / 73533	1/ 3#	\$10.32	0.215	\$1,548.65	McCormick 979614	48 oz	\$10.82	.2254 oz	\$1,623.00
194	25	Spice, Oregano - Sauer 1866 or equal. (325oz)	C.F.SAUER / 02234	1/12 OZ	\$6.57	0.5475	\$177.94	Sysco/McCormick 932466	13 oz	\$10.00	0.7692	\$249.99
195	30	Spice, Paparika - Sauer 2235 or equal. (540oz)	C.F.SAUER / 02235	1/16 OZ	\$4.42	0.2763	\$149.20	Sysco/McCormick 974312	18 oz	\$7.47	0.4150	\$224.10
196	30	Spice, Pepper, Black, Ground: Fancy blend of choicest Malabar and Langpong black peppers. Fine grind. 6/18oz/cs. McCormick 932441 or equal (3240oz)	C.F.SAUER / 00987	1/16 OZ	\$8.12	0.5	\$1,620.00	McCormick 932441	18 oz	\$12.73	0.7072	\$2,418.62
197	30	Spice, Salt, Iodized: All purpose salt, fine grain, iodized, based on 24/20 oz.	DIAMOND CR / 00306	24/26OZ	\$12.90	0.0207	\$386.92	Sysco 4002994	24/26 oz	\$11.30	.0181 oz	\$339.00
198	50	Spice, Southwest Chipotle Seasoning Blend: Spices (sweet chili pepper, chipotle chili pepper, cayenne pepper, oregano, thyme, cumin, parsley, savory, marjoram, bay, basil, rosemary, mustard, coriander) to include natural chipotle pepper flavor. Mrs. Dash MD-32 or equal	MRS DASH / J073-DB900	12/2.5Z.	\$27.47	0.9157	\$1,373.54	Mrs. Dash MD-32	12/2.5 oz	\$28.38	.946 oz	\$1,419.00
199	50	Spice, Taco Seasoning: P.E.T. or vacuum sealed jars. 22oz/cs. McCormick 80615 or equal (1100oz)	MCCORMICK / 080615	6/22 Z	\$41.31	0.313	\$344.30	McCormick 80615	22 oz	\$7.11	0.3231	\$355.41
200	50	Spice, Vegetable Seasoning: P.E.T. or vacuum sealed jars. Blend of spices, herbs and vegetables (including onions, tomatoes, garlic, red bell peppers, sun-dried tomatatoes, leeks and chives). 21oz/cs. McCormick 900036607 or equal (1050oz)	MCCORMICK / 036607	6/20 Z	\$56.20	0.4683	\$491.72	McCormick 036607	20 oz	\$9.40	0.4700	\$493.50
201	50	Sugar, Brown: Golden light brown, 100% pure cane sugar, based on 12/2# . Imperial 123130 or equal (1200#)	IMPERIAL / 123130	12/2#	\$25.08	1.045	\$1,254.00	Domino 404213	25#	\$21.78	0.8712	\$1,045.44
202	50	Sugar, Granulated: 100% granulated cane sugar in 10# bags/cs Larger size bags are not acceptable. Imperial 120052 or equal.	IMPERIAL / 120208	4/10#	\$29.71	0.7428	\$1,485.48	Domino 400368	10/4#	\$28.20	.705#	\$1,410.00

SPEC #	BID QTY (CS)	ITEM DESCRIPTION	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
VEGETABLES (frozen & canned)												
203	100	Blackeyed Peas, Canned - Uniform in size and color, US Grade A, canned. 6/#10cans/cs. Allen 57213 or equal.	ALLEN / 57213	6/ 10	\$23.17	0.1854	\$2,317.20	Bush 01659	6/#10	\$21.26	0.1476	\$2,126.00
204	100	Black Beans, Canned - US Grade A. Uniform size, packed in water. 6/#10/cs. Allens 32213 or equal.	ALLEN / 32213	6/10	\$20.21	0.1617	\$2,021.28	Bush 01885	6/#10	\$21.81	0.1514	\$2,181.00
205	1000	Broccoli, Florets, Frozen - Grade A, standard, uniform size, fancy flower with attached stem no longer than one (1) inch. Bright, characteristic green color. IQF. 12/2#/cs. Simplot 24664 or equal.	SIMPLOT / 824664	12/2#	\$27.48	0.2114	\$27,483.87	Simplot 24664	12/2 #	\$27.33	0.2135	\$27,330.00
206	500	California Blend, Frozen - vegetable blend of 40% broccoli cuts, 30% bias sliced carrots and 30% cauliflower florets. IQF. Packed 12/2#/cs. Simplot 188339 or equal.	SIMPLOT / 18833	12/ 2#	\$27.16	0.2122	\$13,580.65	Simplot 188339	12/2 #	\$25.88	0.2021	\$12,940.00
207	400	Carrots, Crinkle Cut, Frozen - carrot slices, maximum diameter one (1) inch, packed to be Grade A standard, bright orange-yellow color. IQF. 12/2#packages/cs. Simplot 73466 or equal.	SIMPLOT / 73466	12/2 #	\$19.11	0.1493	\$7,643.48	Simplot 73466	12/2 #	\$19.34	0.1510	\$7,736.00
208	1200	Corn, Whole Kernel, Canned: Golden, US Grade A, small kernel, quick cooked. Minimum drain weight 70 oz (non-reactive containers). No sugar added. 6/#10. Stokely 92851 or equal.	SENECA / 68117	6/ 10	\$24.39	0.1951	\$29,272.34	Sysco 4015665	6/#10	\$22.23	0.1543	\$26,676.00
209	100	Beans, Garbanzo: Canned, USDA Grade A. No salt added. 6-#10 can/cs Allen 74213 or equal.	ALLEN / 74213	6/ 10	\$20.45	0.1636	\$2,045.20	Bush 01701	6/#10	\$22.75	0.1579	\$2,275.00
210	100	Beans, Kidney: Canned, USDA Grade A. No salt added. 6-#10 cans/cs. Allen 41213 or equal.	ALLEN / 41213	6/ 10	\$23.35	0.1868	\$2,335.23	Bush 01745	6/#10	\$22.75	0.1579	\$2,275.00
211	200	Beans, Green, Frozen: IQF. 1.5" Fleshy tender pods. No tough strings. 12/32oz per case. Simplot 18039 or equal.	SIMPLOT / 18039	12/ 2#	\$22.75	0.1777	\$4,550.98	Simplot 18039	12/2 #	\$22.12	0.1728	\$4,424.00
212	200	Beans, Green, Cut, Canned: US Grade A Northwest Oregon "Blue Lake" variety. 1# center cut, 3 sieve, heavy pack, minimum drain weight 60 oz. 6/#10. Allen 1215 or Stokely's 02659 or equal.	ALLEN / 01215	6/ #10	\$19.89	0.1591	\$3,978.26	Sysco/Allen 1215	6/#10	\$22.80	0.1583	\$4,560.00
213	100	Beans, Vegetarian, Canned - Baked beans in a tangy tomato sauce with brown sugar and extra seasonings. 6/#10. Allens 42219 or equal.	ALLEN / 42219	6 / #10	\$30.21	0.2417	\$3,021.16	Allen 42219	6/#10	\$31.73	0.2203	\$3,173.00
214	100	Edamame: Shelled, Frozen. Simplot 2768 or equal.	SIMPLOT / 52276	6/2.5	\$27.78	0.3473	\$2,778.14	Simplot 2768	6/2.5 #	\$28.14	0.1753	\$2,814.00
215	100	Guacamole, Frozen: No additives or preservatives. No heat treatment. All natural ingredients. 6/2# per case. Simplot 9015802 or equal.	SIMPLOT / 01580	6/2#	\$38.04	0.5944	\$3,804.30	Simplot 9015802	6/2 #	\$38.46	3.205#	\$3,846.00

SPEC #	BID QTY (CS)	ITEM DESCRIPTION	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
216	150	Mixed Vegetables, Frozen - packed to be Grade A standard. To contain green peas, diced carrots, sweet cut corn, 1/2" cut green beans and lima beans. 12/2.5#pkg/cs. Simplot 188117 or equal.	SIMPLOT / 18811	12/ 2.5#	\$30.59	0.0637	\$4,588.71	Simplot 188117	12/2.5 #	\$28.39	0.1774	\$4,258.50
217	200	Peas, Green, Frozen - Grade A standard, sweet or early June variety, 3 to 4 sieve. 12/2.5#/cs. Simplot 18949 or equal.	SIMPLOT / 18949	12/ 2.5#	\$33.53	0.0699	\$6,706.52	Simplot 18949	12/2.5 #	\$29.83	0.1864	\$5,966.00
218	100	Peppers, Jalapeno, Sliced, Pouch Pack: Thick-walled jalapenos with more slices than pieces, mild heat level, packed in the US, packed in flexible 5# pouches. Vlassic 31761 or equal (4000#)	CAJUN CHEF / 31314	8/5LB	\$28.71	0.718	\$2,872.00	Clemente Jacques 76013	6/#10	\$21.95	0.5500	\$2,200.00
219	200	Pinto Beans - Packed in water and salt. US Grade A. Calcium disodium EDTA for color retention required. Minimum drain weight 78 oz. 6/#10. Allen 35213 or equal.	ALLEN / 35213	6/#10	\$19.08	0.1526	\$3,816.00	Allen 35213	6/#10	\$18.96	0.1316	\$3,792.00
220	150	Sonoma Blend, Frozen - vegetable blend of 30% broccoli florets, 27% sugar snap peas, 22% carrots, 21% yellow carrots. Packed 8/3#/cs. Simplot 003762 or equal.	SIMPLOT / 003762	8/3 #	\$30.51	0.2384	\$4,576.50	Simplot 003762	8/3 #	\$32.72	0.2556	\$4,908.00
221	100	Spinach, Frozen - chopped in 1/4" pieces, consists of 80% leaf and 20% or less, stem. Packed to be Grade A standard. Wet pack. 12/3#pkg/cs. Simplot 19022 or equal.	SIMPLOT / 19022	12/ 3#	\$33.72	0.3665	\$3,372.34	Simplot 19022	12/3 #	\$32.88	0.1712	\$3,288.00
222	150	Sugar Snap Peas, Frozen - uniform in size full-length and bright green sugar snap pea pods. Packed 12/2#pkg/cs. Simplot 189336 or equal.	SIMPLOT / 18933	12/2#	\$30.26	0.2364	\$4,538.71	Simplot 189336	12/2 #	\$31.13	0.2432	\$4,669.50
PAPER												
223	30	BAG PAPER 8# 2500/cs	DURO / 80984	1/500	\$13.88	0.0278	416.5259	Sysco 5113410	2/500 ct	\$23.96	0.0240	\$718.80
224	30	BAG, PLASTIC FOOD High-Density, Clear, 10X14. 1000/cs. ELKAY #BOR1014HG or equal.	ELKAY / BOR1014HD	1/1000	\$17.21	0.0172	516.2556	Elkay BOR1014HD	1000 ct	\$13.09	0.0130	\$392.70
225	275	BAG, PLASTIC PRINTED High Density 5.7x5.5 Hi-Den Cookie 2000/cs ELKAY #DP5555PCL or equal.	ELKAY / DP5555PCK	1/2000	\$10.12	0.0051	2784.1422	Elkay DP5555PCK	2000 ct	\$7.70	0.0038	\$2,117.50
226	75	BAG, PLASTIC UNPRINTED High-Density 6.5x7. ELKAY #DP657 or equal.	ELKAY / DP657	10/200	\$11.25	0.0056	843.8596	Elkay DP657	2000 ct	\$8.14	0.0040	\$610.50
227	15	BAG, RECLOSABLE PLASTIC 1 Qt., 7x8 ELKAY #F20708Q or equal.	ELKAY / F20708	1/1000	\$22.16	0.0222	332.4000	Elkay F20708Q	500 ct	\$10.73	0.0214	\$160.95
228	15	BAG, RECLOSABLE PLASTIC 1 gal. 2mil. 1000/cs ELKAY #F21012 or equal.	ELKAY / F21012	1/1000	\$45.11	0.0451	676.6500	Elkay F21012G	250 ct	\$10.73	0.0429	\$160.95
229	15	BOWL, PAPER NATURAL WHITE 11 oz. Round, Made with recyclable and compostable material. 50/sleeve. 20/50cs. GENPAK #HF812 or equal.	GENPAK / HF812	1/1000	\$56.78	0.0568	851.7000	Genpak HF812	20/50 ct	\$61.95	0.0619	\$929.25
230	15	BOWL, FOAM 5 oz. Round, Laminated, White or Pearl. 50/sleeve. 20/50. DART 5BWWQ or equal.	DART / 5BWWQ	8/125	\$17.38	0.0174	260.7065	Sysco/Pactiv 0996429	8/125 ct	\$22.28	0.0222	\$334.20
231	15	BOWL, CLEAR 6 oz. (for round fresh fruit) 3-7/8"x3-3/4"x1-1/2". 2000/cs PARPAK #21838 or equal.	R3/MAX / 21838	1/2000	\$41.49	0.0207	622.3370	Par Pak 21838	2000 ct	\$36.80	0.0184	\$552.00

SPEC #	BID QTY (CS)	ITEM DESCRIPTION	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
232	10	CONTAINER, PAPER NATURAL WHITE Hinged, 3 Compartment 8x7.8x2.5. Made with recyclable and compostable material. 2000/cs GENPAK #HF243 or equal.	BRIDGEGATE / ECO-8-3	200	\$49.39	0.2470	493.9000	Genpak HF243	200 ct	\$45.11	0.2255	\$451.10
233	75	CONTAINER, PAPER NATURAL WHITE Hinged, No compartment 9.2x9.1x2.1. Made with recyclable and compostable material.200/cs. GENPAK #HF200 or equal.	GENPAK / HF200	200	\$50.00	0.2500	3750.0000	Genpak HF200	200 ct	\$53.53	0.2676	\$4,014.75
234	10	CONTAINER, FOAM 4 oz. Round, Squat 50/sleeve. 20/50. DART #4J6 or equal.	DART / 4J6	20/ 50	\$16.10	0.0161	160.9783	Dart 4J6	1000 ct	\$16.29	0.0162	\$162.90
235	50	CONTAINER, FOAM 6 oz HINGED. 4/125/sleeve. DART #60HT1 or equal.	DART / 60HT1	1/500CT	\$16.80	0.0336	840.1323	Sysco/Pactiv 7336805	500 ct	\$21.71	0.0434	\$1,085.50
236	10	CONTAINER, FOAM HOT DOG. White. 4/125.GENPAK #2110 or equal.	GENPAK / 21100	4/125CT	\$27.29	0.0546	272.9000	Sysco/Pactiv 8119089	504 ct	\$30.10	0.0597	\$301.00
237	75	CONTAINER, SMALL PLASTIC BLACK with CLEAR DOME LID. 1 Compartment. 5-7/8"x4"x2-5/8". PARPAK #21121 or equal.	PARPAK / 21121	1/250CT	\$37.66	0.1507	2824.7588	Par Pak 21121	250 ct	\$35.15	0.1406	\$2,636.25
238	525	CONTAINER, PLASTIC 5oz. BLACK (for offer vs serve) 3-1/16"x3-1/16"x1-1/14". 2500/cs.PARPAK #21929 or equal.	R3/MAX / 21929	1/2500	\$29.05	0.0116	15250.2674	Par Pak 21929	2500 ct	\$26.22	0.0104	\$13,765.50
239	48	CONTAINER, BAGUETTE 9.5"x3.25"x2.5". 250/cs.	BAGCRAFT / 300080	500	\$92.63	0.1853	4446.2400	Pactiv 7289764	250 ct	\$38.88	0.1555	\$1,866.24
240	48	CONTAINER, SALAD SMALL, 5"x5"x2.5". 250/cs. BAGCRAFTER #300093 or equal. (NO AWARD)	BAGCRAFT / 300093	500	\$76.25	0.1525				No Bid		
241	48	CONTAINER, SALAD LARGE 6.75"x5"x2.5". 250/cs. BAGCRAFTER #300094 or equal. (NO AWARD)	BAGCRAFT / 300094	500	\$82.84	0.1657				No Bid		
242	56	CONTAINER, SANDWICH WEDGE 6.75"x3.25"x3.5". 500/cs. Anchor#41202 or equal.	ANCHOR / 41202	250	\$48.53	0.1941	2717.4737	Par Pak 21507	500 ct	\$28.77	0.0575	\$1,611.12
243	56	CONTAINER, TORTILLA PACK 4.5"x4.75"x2". 500/cs Bagcrafter #30094 or equal. (NO AWARD)	BAGCRAFT / 300094	500	\$82.84	0.1657				No Bid		
244	75	CUP CLEAR 9oz (not translucent) 20/50 sleeve/cs. DART#TP9R or equal.	DART / TP9R	20/50CT	\$47.76	0.0478	3582.2581	Sysco/Pairie Pkg 7473299	15/65 ct	\$52.50	0.0538	\$3,937.50
245	10	CUP CLEAR 16oz (not translucent). 20/50 sleeve. DART #TP16D or equal.	SOLO / TP16D	20/50	\$61.31	0.0613	613.0851	Sysco/Prairie Pkg 7474812	10/70 ct	\$53.73	0.0767	\$537.30
246	15	CUP FOAM SQUAT 4oz Round, Laminated white or pearl. 50/sleeve. 20/50sleeve/cs. DART 4J6 or equal.	DART / 4J6	20/ 50	\$16.10	0.0161	241.4674	Dart 4J6	1000 ct	\$16.29	0.0162	\$244.35
247	15	CUP FOAM SQUAT 8oz Round. Laminated white or pearl. 20-50/sleeve.20-50/sleeve. DART#8SJ12 or equal.	DART / 8SJ12	20/ 50	\$23.50	0.0235	352.5488	Dart 8SJ12	20/50 ct	\$24.05	0.0240	\$360.75

SPEC #	BID QTY (CS)	ITEM DESCRIPTION	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
248	175	CUP FOAM 8oz Round, Laminated white or pearl. 40-25/sleeve/cs. DART 8J8 or equal.	DART / 8J8	40/ 25	\$15.64	0.0156	2737.2283	Dart 8J8	40/25 ct	\$15.82	0.0158	\$2,768.50
249	10	CUP FOAM 10oz 40-25/sleeve/cs. DART#10J10 or equal.	DART / 10J10	40/ 25	\$19.99	0.0200	199.8909	Dart 10J10	40/25 ct	\$20.35	0.0203	\$203.50
250	10	CUP FOAM 12oz. 25/sleeve. 40-25 sleeve/cs. DART #12J12 or equal.	DART / 12J12	40/ 25	\$22.14	0.0221	221.3666	Dart 12J12	1000 ct	\$22.66	0.0226	\$226.60
251	25	CUP FOAM SOUP 12oz. 20-25 sleeve/cs. DART #12SJ20	DART / 12SJ20	20/ 25	\$17.39	0.0174	434.7826	Dart 12SJ20	500 ct	\$17.60	0.0352	\$440.00
252	50	CUP PORTION 1 oz. Paper Souffle. 250/sleeve. 20-250 sleeve/case. GENPAK #F100 or equal.	GENPAK / F100	20/250CT	\$42.73	0.0085	2136.4130	Solo 7930985	10/250 ct	\$23.59	0.0094	\$1,179.50
253	115	CUP PORTION 2 oz. Paper Souffle 250/sleeve. 20-250 sleeve/case. GENPAK #F200	GENPAK / F200/3200	20/250CT	\$51.64	0.0103	5938.6000	Solo 7931181	10/250 ct	\$32.94	0.0131	\$3,788.10
254	55	CUP PORTION 2oz Plastic. 125/sleeve. 20-125 sleeve/cs. DART 200PC or equal.	DART / 200PC	20/125	\$24.53	0.0098	1349.2553	Sysco/Prairie Pkg 7790239	12/200 ct	\$26.82	0.0111	\$1,475.10
255	15	CUTTER for 18" box of plastic wrap. 1/cs. Sliderbar#HD438 or equal. (NO AWARD)	ANCHOR / HD438/437	1/18"	\$4.00	4.0000				See Line 271		
256	55	LID, CUP PLASTIC for 2oz plastic portion cup 125sleeve. 20-125 sleeve/cs. DART#200PCL or equal.	DART / PL2N	20/125	\$21.66	0.0087	1191.0636	Sysco/Prairie Pkg 7790795	24/100 ct	\$22.80	0.0095	\$1,254.00
257	800	LID, CLEAR UNIVERSAL for 5oz container plastic black (lid for offer vs serve container line #295) 3-23/32"x3-23/32"x9/16". 2500/cs. ParPak #29332 or equal.	PARPAK / 29332	1/2500	\$50.53	0.0202	40425.5319	Par Pak 29332	2500 ct	\$46.49	0.0185	\$37,192.00
258	25	LID, PLASTIC for 8oz & 12oz styrofoam soup bowl. 100 ct. 10-100 sleeve/cs. DART 20JL or equal.	DART / 20JL	10/ 100	\$15.63	0.0156	390.7609	Dart 20JL	10/100 ct	\$15.96	0.0159	\$399.00
259	100	NAPKINS (for DISPENSER) 7x12 or 7x13. 40-250/cs. GB#55712 or equal.	R3/MAX / D20500	20/500	\$27.23	0.0027	2722.5806	Sysco 7334706	16/625 ct	\$43.97	0.0043	\$4,397.00
260	300	PAN LINER 25#. 16x25x24.5. 1/1000/cs. Primesource #25QPL or equal.	PAPERCON / 25QPL	1/1000	\$29.02	0.0290	8705.5016	Primesource 25QPL	1000 ct	\$29.39	0.0293	\$8,817.00
261	15	STRAWS, PLASTIC Wrapped, Jumbo 7.75" 500/bx. 24-500/cs. Cello Straw #9731 or equal.	PRIMESOURC E / 76009731	24/500	\$39.98	0.0033	599.7000	Sysco/Prairie Pkg 0191516	12000 ct	\$58.25	0.0048	\$873.75
262	6,000	TRAY, 5 COMPARTMENT FOAM WHITE. 8x10x1. 4-125/cs. Republic 97046 or equal	R3/MAX / YTH105	1/500	\$17.24	0.0345	103469.3878	Sysco/Pactiv 0430294	500 ct	\$16.74	0.0334	\$100,440.00
263	700	TRAY, FLAT CARRY FOAM White 9x12.5 1-250/cs. GenPak #10009L or equal.	GENPAK / TH1034	1/250CT	\$25.83	0.1108	18081.0000	Pactiv OTH10034	250 ct	\$20.20	0.0808	\$14,140.00
264	150	TRAY, FOOD PAPER 8 oz. Basketweave red/white. 4-250/cs. SQP #8708 or equal.	DOPACO / 08708	4/ 250	\$14.41	0.0144	2162.0022	Southern Champion 0409	1000 ct	\$14.11	0.0141	\$2,116.50
265	150	TRAY, FOOD PAPER 2#. #200 Basketweave. 4-250/cs. SQP 8702 or equal.	DOPACO / 8702	4/ 250	\$19.71	0.0197	2956.4516	Southern Champion 0417	1000 ct	\$21.63	0.0216	\$3,244.50

SPEC #	BID QTY (CS)	ITEM DESCRIPTION	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	VENDOR BRAND/ MFG CODE	PACK SIZE	CASE PRICE	EACH PRICE	TOTAL PRICE		
266	13,000	UTENSIL, CUTLERY KIT Packaged Elite, POLY Propylene. Med. Weight. Fork, Spoon, Napkin, & Straw. No knife. 1/500/cs. Primesource #02896 or equal.	PRIME SOUR / 02896	1/500CT	\$14.46	0.0289	187918.0151	Dispozo P513MSKIT	500 ct	\$17.52	0.0350	\$227,760.00		
267	55	UTENSILS, FORKS, PLASTIC Poly Propylene, White. Med. weight 1/1,000. Primesource #2691 or equal.	PRIME SOUR / 02691	1/1000	\$7.50	0.0075	412.3429	Prairie Pkg 1155730	1000 ct	\$8.13	0.0081	\$447.15		
268	80	UTENSILS, KNIVES, PLASTIC Poly Propylene, White. Medium weight. 1/1000/cs. Primesource #2690 or equal.	PRIME SOUR / 02690	1/1000	\$7.50	0.0075	599.7714	Prairie Pkg 1155769	1000 ct	\$8.13	0.0081	\$650.40		
269	175	UTENSILS, SPOONS, PLASTIC Poly Propylene, White. Medium weight. 1/1000. Primesorce #2694 or equal.	PRIME SOUR / 2694	1/1000	\$7.50	0.0075	1312.5000	Prairie Pkg 1155789	1000 ct	\$8.13	0.0081	\$1,422.75		
270	60	UTENSIL, CUTLERY KIT SPORKS Med. Weight. Spork, napkin, & straw. SUMMER FEEDING ONLY. 1/1000/cs. Primesource 108 or equal.	PRIME SOUR / 0108	1/1000	\$17.58	0.0176	1055.0598	Prairie Pkg 2915645	1000 ct	\$20.16	0.0201	\$1,209.60		
271	150	WRAP, FILM PVC Plastic 18"x2000'. 1/cs. Rest Pride #182FA or equal	WESTERN / 182FA	1/2000'	\$14.12	14.1200	2118.5567	Sysco/Pactiv 9063	1-18x200 roll	\$14.74	14.7400	\$2,211.00		
272	175	WRAP, FOIL, ALUMINUM 18/500' .MUST BE HEAVY WEIGHT. 1/cs. Rest Pride #297FA	WESTERN / 297FA	18/500'	\$24.31	1.3506	4255.0963	Sysco/Pactiv W69328	1-18x500 roll	\$25.29	25.2900	\$4,425.75		
273	15	WRAP, FOIL, SHEETS 9x10.75, 500/cs. 6-500/cs. Rest Pride #62FA or equal	REYNOLDS / 632FA	6/ 500	\$44.80	0.0149	671.9355	Sysco/Pactiv W69372	6/500 ct	\$41.95	0.0139	\$629.25		
274	100	WRAP SANDWICH FOIL RED CHECK. 1/500/cs. BC#300827 or equal	BAGCRAFT / 300827	4/500	\$52.96	0.0265	5295.7895	Reynolds 7524	5/500 ct	\$53.77	0.0215	\$5,377.00		
275	50	WRAP, PAPER Check Red/White. 1/1000/cs. BG300358 or equal.	BAGCRAFT / 300317	2/1000	\$32.02	0.0160	1601.0638	Specialty Pkg 1240-2	2000 ct	\$32.98	0.0164	\$1,649.00		
276	10	WRAP, PAPER TISSUE Menu 14 x 14 White. 1000/cs. BG #EW1414 or equal.	BAGCRAFT / EW1414	1000	\$17.32	0.0173	173.2000	Sysco 1235498	1000 ct	\$8.28	0.0082	\$82.80		
277	20	WRAP, WAX PAPER 250 ft roll. 1/6 rolls/cs.Reynolds #79552 or equal. (NO AWARD)	REYNOLDS / 7955	6/250'	\$37.11	6.1850				No Bid				
							Food Items Total	\$2,464,778.59					Food Items Total	\$2,493,472.04
							Non-Food Total	\$441,985.43					Non-Food Total	\$465,770.86
							Grand Total	\$2,906,764.02					Grand Total	\$2,959,242.90